
5. Micro Irrigation Fund scheme 

National Bank for Agriculture and Rural Development (NABARD) has 
created a Micro Irrigation Fund with a corpus of Rs. 5,000 crore 
implemented from 2019-20. The objective of the fund is to facilitate 
the states in availing an interest subvented loan for expanding 
coverage of micro irrigation facilities by taking up special and 
innovative projects and also for incentivising micro irrigation beyond 
the provisions available under PMKSY to encourage farmers to install 
micro irrigation systems. 

6. Mission Organic Value Chain Development for 
North Eastern Region (MOVCDNER) 

MOVCDNER aims to develop the certified organic production in a value 
chain mode to link farmers with consumers and to support the 
development of entire value chain starting from organic inputs, seeds, 
certification and creation of facilities for collection, aggregation, 
processing, marketing and brand building initiatives. The scheme is 
being implemented in north eastern states Arunachal Pradesh, 
Assam, Manipur, Meghalaya, Mizoram, Nagaland, Sikkim and Tripura 

7. E-NAM 

In order connect the existing agricultural mandis on a common online 
market platform for trading agricultural commodities, Government of 
India, launched a pan-India portal, e-National Agriculture Market 
(eNAM) on April 14, 2016. 

So far, e-NAM has connected nearly 1,000 mandis in 18 states and 
three union territories. Implemented by Small Farmers Agribusiness 
Consortium (SFAC), eNAM aims at reducing transaction costs, 
bridging information asymmetries, and helping expansion of market 
access for farmers and other stakeholders. Since the implementation, 
e-NAM has registered a user base of 1.66 crore farmers, 1.31 lakh 
traders, 73,151 commission agents and 1,012 farmer producer 
organisation (FPOs). 

 

 


